
 

An Unstructured Web Mining For The Recognition 

About Women Policies of Jaipur Urban Areas In 

Rajasthan  
 

 

Mrs. Pooja Jain 

Department of Computer Science & 

Information Technology 

JayotiVidyapeeth Women’s University, 

Jaipur (Rajasthan) 

Pooja1981jain@yahoo.com 

 

Prof. S. Lal 

Department of Science & Technology 

JayotiVidyapeeth Women’s University, 

Jaipur (Rajasthan) 

dean.fet@jvwu.ac.in 

Abstract— Web mining is one of the distillate techniques 

across the World. It is the cornerstone of internet searching. 

Technology is going to advance observation around web and it 

pioneers the massive learning. When one thinks about the 

policies of women, one has to explore for plentiful websites. 

Using the World Wide Web (W.W.W.), policies can be 

collected by Content Mining to extract the full data for 

implement over the integration of data. It will explore to be 

aware about the perception of securing total satisfaction for a 

woman. So for obtaining it is grasping the way how one can 

identify the navigation behavior using the unstructured 

mining. This will make the women to the necessity of 

recognition as a reality. This paper focuses on Unstructured 

Interviews of urban areas for getting data collection. It is 

analyzed about the policies for Text Summarization using 

Python. After analysis in the selected urban area of Jaipur, it is 

revealed that women have very little knowledge about their 

policies and need to be more and more aware by using web 

mining. At last implementation phase describes an easy way to 

access the women’s policies by creating codes and generated 

web page. 
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I. INTRODUCTION  

Web Mining is the technique to extricate knowledgeable 
data from Web sites. It penetrates the overall wealth of 
intelligent data from the World Wide Web. Web mining 
opens the path for searching dynamic, interrelated Web 
Pages. It uncovers all the information saved behind the 
W.W.W. It evaluates valuable patterns. Web mining 
encompasses three ways as Web Content Mining, Web 
Structure Mining and Web Usage Mining. Web Content 
Mining follows different methods for excavation such as 
Unstructured Mining, Structured Mining, Semi-Structured 
Mining and Multimedia Mining. The hidden Web sources 
are usually acquired with Unstructured Web Mining. 
Unstructured or Text Mining can be done in many forms like 
Information Extraction, Topic Tracking, Summarization, 
Categorization, Clustering and Information Visualization. 
Jaipur is the 10th most popular district of India and the 
capital of Rajasthan. In this paper, it has mentioned 6 out of 
13 urban areas of Jaipur as Jaipur, Chomu, Kotputli, Chaksu, 
Shahpura, and Phulera. Data about acknowledgement of 
policies from 6 urban areas are being collected by 
unstructured interview. After applying Text Mining, it is 
concluded that Rajasthan government has included many 
points of women’s policies which can be accessed and 
understood using Generated codes and Web pages like to 
promote the standards of health and survival of women, 

allowing opportunities for a safe and effective 
environment,make employment, skilled development and 
entrepreneurship successful,  give equal status in political 
and social areas for decision and representation, provide 
legislation to end discrimination and violence, elevate 
awareness about solar energy and bio-gas, ensuring shelter 
and property control through legislative and administrative 
measures, granting opportunities to women in schemes, 
programs, or institutes and confirming the right to respect 
and equality to women. 

II. OBJECTIVE 

The web is a way to store massive data. It is necessary to 
make the women of the urban area to be aware of policies 
through web mining. It is essentialfor finding an objective, 
having a systematic knowledge and searching idea to collect 
the data. There must be kept about the requirement to 
enhance women’s participation and the need in Web Mining. 
This research paper contains objective of 
achievingawareness among women and get satisfaction to 
access the government schemes. For framing this to the 
depth and effective direction it will be established to apply 
text mining and then formulate into generated web page. 

III. LITERATURE SURVEY 

A. Khalil, Mohammed Farooque (2016) [9] 

The author describes data warehousing which is 
beneficial in decision-making. Data mining analyzes the 
problem and leads us to the appropriate result. The Data 
warehouse develops and contains the Client Information 
Management (CIM) and System Development Life Cycle 
(SDLC) of the project.  Data mining applies to stored 
information of the data warehouse. The data warehouse 
accesses stakeholders for the future by using data mining. 

B. Gopalakrishnan T (2017)[11] 

In this paper, it elaborates on the classification of web 
pages for improving the clarity of Web search. It uses the 
Sentiment classification for the extraction of knowledge. 
Here the research stresses three phases of Web page 
classification techniques. It shows the highest degree of 
similarity and dissimilarity according to clusters in the first 
phase with reduced computation time and training time. 
Fuzzy clustering suggests to all data having minimum 
distances from all centers in the second phase. Escalation of 
the Fuzzy C-Means algorithm performs in the third phase.   
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C. Leila Shahmoradi (2014)[12] 

The author has examined that information should retrieve 
according to the similarities of documents. We seem that 
web pages have clustered by using algorithms and Structures 
as Cross-page links and In-page links have implemented. 
The experimented consequences are seen effectual to the 
structures of Web pages in institution’s websites. Author 
centers of attention on virtual structures of Websites. 

D. Pooja Sharma, RupaliBhartiya (2012)[13] 

This paper explains a new algorithm for locating data 
clustering. It is one of the web mining techniques. The author 
aims to become betterment of accessing Web log files. It 
proposes an algorithm for improving time complexity 
concerning maintain log data. It seems to be typical without 
the use of log data of a particular user. It has implemented by 
an algorithm according to the access pattern of web pages for 
user identification. Web Usage Mining has obtained through 
the proposed algorithm. 

E. S.Vijayarani, E. Suganya, M. Prakathambal (2018)[14] 

This paper has impacted on varieties of log files for web 
usage mining research. Through a web browser, when 
anyone searches for web pages, it creates a log file with the 
user’s time, URL, etc. Using Data Processing, log files pre-
processes for getting applicable and inapplicable data. In 
this, a survey reports about Web server data, Web server 
logs, etc. 

F. Peter Svec, LubomirBenko, MiroslavKadlecik, 

JanKratochvil, Michal Munk (2020)[22] 

The author has concluded about the importance of pre-
processing data. It has also described about the mistakes in 
the Web Usage Mining. As pre-processing phase has affect 
on the quality. If one makes underestimation about pre-
processing then it will be directly affect on gained 
knowledge. 

G. RituBeniwal, Vandana Tanwar (2014)[16] 

The author mentions the Web Personalization to solve the 
needs of a particular user. Personalization adopts the 
requirement, navigational behavior, correlation with Web 
techniques, etc of user’s choice by analyzing. Web 
Personalization has implemented using four techniques as 
Decision Technique, Hyperlink Based Technique, Content-
Based Filtering, and Collaborative Filtering.  

H. AndemariamMebrahtu, BaluSrinivasulu (2017)[20] 

Researchers have worked on Web Content Mining 
Techniques and Tools. These are in the form of unstructured 
and heterogeneous data on www. Users randomly mine to 
the remarkable information from the internet. Further, data 
organizes into a structured and Semi-structured form through 
web content mining. Exploratory Mining Tools and 
Techniques have used for huge information collection. 

I. R.Malarvizhi, K.Saraswathi (2013)[19] 

Researchers use the techniques and algorithms of Web 
Content Mining. These are related to information retrieval, 
Database Management Systems, and Artificial Intelligence. 
It depicts the importance of classification algorithms such as 
Decision Tree, K-Nearest Neighbor, Naive Bayes, Support 

Vector Machine, and Neural Network. It presents how to 
increase information by using more and more data. 

IV. EXECUTION OF WOMEN POLICIES 

In the execution of women’s policy, it is initialized the 
variables as Unstructured Interviews, Government Women 
Policies-Websites and Awareness of Women. It is applied 
Unstructured Text Summarization Techniques using Python. 
Then codes and pages for women are created using html. If 
one gets a satisfactory result, it will be stopped. Otherwise, 
there will be searched for other Websites and continued the 
same procedure for an acceptable result.  

V. COMPARISION STUDY OF JAIPUR URBAN     

AREAS AND TEXT SUMMARIZATION OF POLICIES 

This comparison study is concerned with the knowledge 
about Women Policies. The Fig. 1 shows the comparison 
code of recognition about policies. It is presented using 5 
urban areas of Jaipur and percentage of awareness about 
policies (see Fig. 2). This is examined that after collection of 
secondary data and analysis among urban areas. There seems 
that it is a crucial matter to grow awareness and it is essential 
to build software for getting benefits from Policies. The 
survey has been reached to the decision that percentage of 
awareness among women is very low by using Fig. 3 and 
Fig. 4.  

 

Fig. 1. Comparison Code of Recognition Table for Women Policies 



 

 

 

Fig. 2. Table for Comparison of Recognition for Women Policies 

 

Fig. 3.  Comparison Code of Recognition Graph for Women Policies 

 

Fig. 4. Comparison Graph of Recognition for Women Policies 

After collecting data from the urban area, the technique 
of increasing acknowledgement about the policies of women 
using text mining will be resolved. Text Summarization 
converts unstructured text of Web data about Policies into 
documents and databases for observation. It is shown below 
an extraction using spaCy, a Natural Language Processing 
tool in Python (see Fig. 5).  

 

 

 

Fig. 5. Text Summarization of Women Policies using Python 

VI. ACCESS OF WOMEN POLICIES BY 

GENERATED CODES 

Today there have women policies in Rajasthan but due to 
the lack of appropriate access to it, women are unable to 
make use of these Policies because of the inappropriate 
education. For creating easily access it can be developed by 
the Website for the implementation. Here the generated 



 

 

codes and webpage for retrieving particular Policies are 
shown below (see Fig. 6 and Fig. 7). 

Accordingly, it has the coding of the Webpage for 
accessing the usable data. There have the hyperlinked 
Policies here. When one clicks on the links another page of 
schemes will be opened. It shows the easy access of 
WebPages. It gives the proper execution for Mining.  

 

Fig. 6. Generated Codes for Women Policies 

 

Fig. 7. Generated Webpage of Women Policies 

VII. RESULTS 

The result is the format that leads the research problem to 
a solution after inputting, analysis and implementation. 
Through this research, it was seen that in which way the use 
of government policies should be made easy. Attitude and 
awareness of women revealed after data collection from 
unstructured interviews. To make the women aware of the 

policies in the urban area, the work became easier by 
adopting Text Summarization Technique. Web pages 
provided an easy way to increase women's satisfaction and 
awareness. 

VIII. SCOPE OF FUTURE RESEARCH 

This research work will be helpful in taking web mining 
forward. By this, web mining tools and websites will be 
developed in different languages using ASP.NET, C#, PHP, 
Python, and SQL Server etc. so it will fulfill the requirement 
of women appropriately. It will certainly provide automated 
accessibility of a secured, filtered, more analyzed and 
manipulated processing. 

CONCLUSION 

This paper reaches the closure of web mining that it can 
be mined for getting fruitful and practical knowledge to 
extract the use of Women Government Policies. The results 
come to the decision that after interacting among urban areas 
for gaining the current scenario of women it is needed to 
implement a clear and easy approach by creating a tool and 
website for theWomen policies. After summing up it defines 
that if one clicks on the corresponding sub-link- Declining 
Child Sex Ratio on the webpage, it is obtained the one 
scheme by the hyperlink. When one uses this type of 
Generated Webpage, it will be found the accurate results. In 
this way, it’s beneficial for women to attain the Women 
Policies. Make use of Web Content Mining and designed 
into the shape of Web Structure is executed more efficiently. 
Further, it will explore to the techniques for automating the 
policies using navigation.     
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